
 

 

 
March 2010 
 
Dear Editor/Producer: 
 
Gary Zukav has transformed the way millions of people view themselves, their relationships, and 
the world around them.  His groundbreaking book on spirituality, The Seat of the Soul, has sold 3 
million copies in the U.S. alone and spent 31 weeks at #1 on the New York Times bestseller list, 
remaining on the list for almost three years. He is a frequent guest on Oprah, and his work has 
been published in twenty-four languages. 
 
Now, in his first major book since The Seat of the Soul, Gary Zukav reveals a revolutionary new 
path for spiritual growth in SPIRITUAL PARTNERSHIP: The New Human Relationship 
Dynamic (HarperOne: April 27, 2010; $25.99, hardcover).  According to Zukav, a spiritual 
partnership is a new relationship dynamic – one between equals for the purpose of spiritual 
growth.  Spiritual partners use information from their inner sources, such as their emotions and 
intuition. They learn how to develop trust in the Universe and choose their intentions 
consciously. Spiritual partnerships exist for a new multisensory humanity that is being born – a 
humanity that is not confined to the limitations of our five senses. Where previously our 
relationships were built around needs, our new relationships are built around cultivating our most 
loving selves.  
 
In the book, Zukav outlines the steps to discovering this profound new relationship dynamic 
which enables and empowers individuals to reach their true potential and discover what he calls 
“authentic power.”  He explains that spiritual partnerships are not exclusively for married or 
committed couples; they can be created in families, between friends, in the workplace, at school 
– anywhere two or more individuals decide to create a relationship as equals.  Their intention to 
grow spiritually with every interaction rather than blame or judge each other when reactions 
occur becomes the defining point of the relationship.   
 
Filled with Gary Zukav’s inspirational prose, his poignant examples and his practical guidance, 
SPIRITUAL PARTNERSHIP empowers and enables us to explore our emotions, our 
intentions, our choices, and our intuition, and to use these experiences to discover profound 
spiritual growth. Here readers will find an in-depth transformational voyage into the deepest, 
most wholesome, and truly refreshing sources of meaning and purpose in our lives.  
 
I encourage you to interview Gary Zukav and/or feature his book and will be in touch soon to 
discuss the possibilities.   For more information about Gary Zukav, visit www.seatofthesoul.com. 
 
Best wishes, 
Megan Beatie 
Goldberg McDuffie Communications 
818-678-6288 mbeatie@goldbergmcduffie.com   

http://www.seatofthesoul.com/
mailto:mbeatie@goldbergmcduffie.com

